

Water & Wastewater Chemicals
Invitation to Bid (ITB) # 1747
Augusta County Service Authority

Monday, January 16, 2017

2:00 PM

Opened By: Casey McCracken

Witness: Tony Morse

BID TABULATION

Vendor	Biocarb DN	Polymer NE-2145	Polymer NE-1802	Polymer NE-1799	Polymer NE-1430	Polymer NE-1948
Polydyne Inc	No Bid	\$0.687/Lb	\$0.687/Lb	\$0.687/Lb	\$0.707/Lb	\$0.687/Lb
Environmental Operating Solutions Inc.	\$1.775/Gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.	No Bid	\$0.8777/Lb	\$0.8777/Lb	\$0.8777/Lb	\$1.1958/Lb	\$1.1958/Lb
Suffolk Sales & Service Corp.	\$1.69/Gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Univar USA Inc.	\$2.46/Gal	\$0.85/Lb	\$0.85/Lb	\$0.85/Lb	\$0.86/Lb	\$0.86/Lb

*Apparent Lowest Responsive & Responsible Bidder. Primary Contract.

**Second Lowest Responsive & Responsible Bidder. Alternate Contract.