

AUGUSTA COUNTY SERVICE AUTHORITY

BID NUMBER:	ITB 1744	COMPANY: Royal Oak Farm LLC CONTACT: Kenneth Newman PHONE: 540-297-3299 FAX:	COMPANY: Green Waste Recyclers CONTACT: George Partlow PHONE: 540-825-1966 FAX:	COMPANY: Blue Ridge Clearing & Grinding LLC CONTACT: Allen Burner PHONE: 540-860-1197 FAX:	COMPANY: Medek Tree Service, Inc. CONTACT: Adam Medek PHONE: 804-746-8580 FAX:	COMPANY: John Hylton Forestry CONTACT: John Hylton PHONE: 540-293-0621 FAX:									
OPENING DATE:	August 2, 2016														
OPENED BY:	Casey McCracken														
WITNESS:	Greg Thomasson														
BID TITLE:	Wood Waste Grinding														
COMMODITY/SERVICE	Estimated Cubic Yards	Lump Sum Price (\$)	\$/CY	Estimated Cubic Yards	Lump Sum Price (\$)	\$/CY	Estimated Cubic Yards	Lump Sum Price (\$)	\$/CY	Estimated Cubic Yards	Lump Sum Price (\$)	\$/CY	Estimated Cubic Yards	Lump Sum Price (\$)	\$/CY
Grind Pile with 6" Screen (Pile A)	16,700	30,895.00	1.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	35,000.00	64,750.00	1.85	27,500.00	46,750.00	1.70	18,777.00	56,331.00	3.00
Grind Stump Pile (Pile B)	1,300	3,887.00	2.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1,050.00	9,087.00	8.65	850.00	3,187.50	3.75	222.00	666.00	3.00
Terms Discount															
Grand Total		34,782.00			No Bid			73,837.00			49,937.50			56,997.00	
Any Deviations (Y/N)		N			N			N			N			N	

Comments: _____

Apparent Low Bidder