

IFB # 1742 - Water and Wastewater Chemicals Due 10/15/2015 @ 2:00 PM -				Submitting Firm's Name	Brenntag Mid-South		Chemtrade Chemicals US, LLC		Geo Specialty Chemicals	
AMENDED BID TALLY SHEET 11-2-201				Required Documentation	Y/N		Y/N		Y	
				MSDS Sheets:	Terms:	N	Terms:	Y	Terms:	Y
				W9 Attached:	Net 30	Y	Net 30	Y	Net 30	Y
				Acknowledge Addendum #1:		Y		Y		Y
				Acknowledge Addendum #2:		N		Y		Y
Item #	Estimated Annual Quantities	Units	Container	Chemical Description	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost
	9,500	gallons	tank truck	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
1	50 750	gallons	15 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	\$ 4.21	\$3,157.50	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	70 3,850	gallons	55 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	\$ 3.39	\$13,051.50	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	20 300	gallons	15 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	\$ 2.45	\$735.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
2	32 1760	gallons	55 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	\$ 1.74	\$3,062.40	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	15,600 42,600	gallons	tank truck	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
3	200 30000	pounds	150 lb. cylinders	Chlorine Liquid gas	\$ 0.79	\$23,700.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
4	12	gallons	55 gallon drums	Citric Acid 50%	\$ 6.09	\$6.09	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
5	3 165	gallons	55 gallon drums	Caustic Soda 25%	\$ 1.69	\$278.85	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
6	6 150	Kg	25Kg pails	Liquid Permanganate	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
7	8,600 155,600	gallons	tank truck	Liquid Alum	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 0.9396	\$146,201.76	\$ 1.1486	\$178,722.16
8	240 10,800	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 35%	\$ 2.45	\$26,460.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
9	120 5,400	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 92.3%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
10	25 1,125	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-sanitizer 2-5/8" disinfecting tablets	\$ 2.14	\$2,407.50	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
11	220 11,000	pounds	50 lb. bags	Soda Ash	\$ 0.24	\$2,684.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00

Color Codes:

 No award due to changes in treatment processes post IFB date

 Apparent low bidder by line item.

 Non-Responsive - Documentation incomplete or missing or pricing not in accordance with submittal requirements.

 Denotes an Alternate Bid, description variance of item or container, or special vendor conditions in bid documents.

 Denotes no award made until fit-for-purpose testing is completed and is satisfactory for ACSA's purposes with the two lowest bidders.

 No Bid, but requested to be kept on bidder's list.

Bid Variances from Solicitation D

 No MSDs sheets submitted

 No Acknowledgement nor submittal of Addendum #2

IFB # 1742 - Water and Wastewater Chemicals Due 10/15/2015 @ 2:00 PM -				Submitting Firm's Name	Univar USA Inc	Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.	Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.			
				Required Documentation	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N			
				MSDS Sheets:	Terms: Y	Terms: Y	Terms: Y			
				W9 Attached:	Net 30 Y	Net 30 Y	Net 30 Y			
				Acknowledge Addendum #1:	Y	Y	Y			
				Acknowledge Addendum #2:	Y	Y	Y			
Item #	Estimated Annual Quantities	Units	Container	Chemical Description	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost
	9,500	gallons	tank truck	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	\$ 1.94	\$18,430.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
1	50 750	gallons	15 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	\$ 3.80	\$2,850.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	70 3,850	gallons	55 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	\$ 3.40	\$11.53	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	20 300	gallons	15 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	\$ 1.78	\$534.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
2	32 1760	gallons	55 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	\$ 1.48	\$2,604.80	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	15,600 42,600	gallons	tank truck	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	\$ 0.76	\$32,376.00	\$ 1.25	\$53,250.00	N/B	\$0.00
3	200 30000	pounds	150 lb. cylinders	Chlorine Liquid gas	\$ 0.56	\$16,800.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
4	12	gallons	55 gallon drums	Citric Acid 50%	\$ 8.06	\$8.06	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 7.759	\$7.76
5	3 165	gallons	55 gallon drums	Caustic Soda 25%	\$ 2.58	\$425.70	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
6	6 150	Kg	25Kg pails	Liquid Permanganate	\$ 5.19	\$778.50	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 2.3971	\$359.57
7	8,600 155,600	gallons	tank truck	Liquid Alum	\$ 0.885	\$137,706.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
8	240 10,800	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 35%	\$ 2.46	\$26,568.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
9	120 5,400	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 92.3%	\$ 2.56	\$13,824.00	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 4.0913	\$22,093.02
10	25 1,125	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-sanitizer 2-5/8" disinfecting tablets	\$ 2.61	\$2,936.25	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
11	220 11,000	pounds	50 lb. bags	Soda Ash	\$ 0.29	\$3,190.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00

Color Codes:

 No award due to changes in treatment processes post IFB date

 Apparent low bidder by line item.

 Non-Responsive - Documentation incomplete or missing or pricing not in accordance with submittal require

 Denotes an Alternate Bid, description variance of item or container, or special vendor conditions in bid doc

 Denotes no award made until fit-for-purpose testing is completed and is satisfactory for ACSA's purposes w

 No Bid, but requested to be kept on bidder's list.

IFB # 1742 - Water and Wastewater Chemicals Due 10/15/2015 @ 2:00 PM -				Submitting Firm's Name		Industrial Chemicals, Inc.		Pencco, Inc.		Shannon Chemical Corporation	
AMENDED BID TALLY SHEET 11-2-201				Required Documentation		Y/N		Y/N		Y/N	
				MSDS Sheets:		Terms:		Terms:		Terms:	
				W9 Attached:		Net 30		Net 30		Net 30	
				Acknowledge Addendum #1:		Y		Y		Y	
				Acknowledge Addendum #2:		Y		Y		Y	
Item #	Estimated Annual Quantities	Units	Container	Chemical Description	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	
	9,500	gallons	tank truck	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 2.26	\$21,470.00	\$ 3.07	\$29,165.00	
1	50 750	gallons	15 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
	70 3,850	gallons	55 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
	20 300	gallons	15 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
2	32 1760	gallons	55 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
	15,600 42,600	gallons	tank truck	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
3	200 30000	pounds	150 lb. cylinders	Chlorine Liquid gas	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
4	12	gallons	55 gallon drums	Citric Acid 50%	\$ 7.73	\$7.73	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 8.26	\$8.26	
5	3 165	gallons	55 gallon drums	Caustic Soda 25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
6	6 150	Kg	25Kg pails	Liquid Permanganate	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
7	8,600 155,600	gallons	tank truck	Liquid Alum	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
8	240 10,800	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 35%	\$ 2.40	\$25,920.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
9	120 5,400	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 92.3%	\$ 2.39583	\$12,937.48	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
10	25 1,125	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-sanitizer 2-5/8" disinfecting tablets	\$ 3.00	\$3,375.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	
11	220 11,000	pounds	50 lb. bags	Soda Ash	\$ 0.32	\$3,520.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	

Color Codes:

No award due to changes in treatment processes post IFB date

Apparent low bidder by line item.

Non-Responsive - Documentation incomplete or missing or pricing not in accordance with submittal requirements

Denotes an Alternate Bid, description variance of item or container, or special vendor conditions in bid documents

Denotes no award made until fit-for-purpose testing is completed and is satisfactory for ACSA's purposes with

No Bid, but requested to be kept on bidder's list.

Bid Variances from Solicitation Documents:

Item #4 is for a 4 drum minimum order quantity

Item #8 is for a 36 pail minimum order quantity

Item #9 is for a 48# pail and for an 18 pail minimum order quantity

Item #20 is for a 6 pail minimum order quantity

Item #11 is for a one pallet minimum order (48 bags/pallet) Price only good to 12/31/15

NOTE: Due to limitations of minimum shipping quantities, bid is deemed non-responsive.

IFB # 1742 - Water and Wastewater Chemicals Due 10/15/2015 @ 2:00 PM -				Submitting Firm's Name	Mosaic Global Sales, Inc.	JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	USALCO		Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.	
AMENDED BID TALLY SHEET 11-2-201				Required Documentation	Y/N	Y/N	Y/N		Y/N	
				MSDS Sheets:	Terms: Y	Terms: Y	Terms: N	Terms: N		
				W9 Attached:	Net 30 Y	Net 30 Y	Net 30 N	Net 30 N		
				Acknowledge Addendum #1:	Y	Y	N	N		
Acknowledge Addendum #2:	Y	Y	N	N						
Item #	Estimated Annual Quantities	Units	Container	Chemical Description	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost	Delivered Unit Price	Total Delivered Cost
	9,500	gallons	tank truck	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	\$ 2.10	\$19,950.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
1	50 750	gallons	15 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	70 3,850	gallons	55 gallon drums	Fluosilicic Acid 23-25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	20 300	gallons	15 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
2	32 1760	gallons	55 gallon drums	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
	15,600 42,600	gallons	tank truck	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% liquichlor	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
3	200 30000	pounds	150 lb. cylinders	Chlorine Liquid gas	N/B	\$0.00	\$ 0.48	\$14,400.00	N/B	\$0.00
4	12	gallons	55 gallon drums	Citric Acid 50%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
5	3 165	gallons	55 gallon drums	Caustic Soda 25%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
6	6 150	Kg	25Kg pails	Liquid Permanganate	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
7	8,600 155,600	gallons	tank truck	Liquid Alum	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
8	240 10,800	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 35%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
9	120 5,400	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-neutralizer tablets - 92.3%	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
10	25 1,125	pounds	45 lb. pails	Bio-sanitizer 2-5/8" disinfecting tablets	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00
11	220 11,000	pounds	50 lb. bags	Soda Ash	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00	N/B	\$0.00

NO BIDS - RETAIN ON BIDDERS LIST

Color Codes:

- No award due to changes in treatment processes post IFB date
- Apparent low bidder by line item.
- Non-Responsive - Documentation incomplete or missing or pricing not in accordance with submittal require
- Denotes an Alternate Bid, description variance of item or container, or special vendor conditions in bid doc.
- Denotes no award made until fit-for-purpose testing is completed and is satisfactory for ACSA's purposes w
- No Bid, but requested to be kept on bidder's list.