

IFB 1728 - Bulk Solar Salt

BID NUMBER:		Bidder Oceanport LLC PO Box 608 Claymont, DE 19703		Bidder Central Salt 385 Airport Rd., Suite 108 Elgin, IL 60123		Bidder Univar USA 1001 Old Bermuda Hundred Rd. Chester, VA 23836		Bidder Harvey Salt Co. 1325 Mohrs Lane Baltimore, MD 21220	
OPENING DATE:		ITB #1728		6/25/2014		Oscar Beasley		Sallie Trimble	
OPENED BY:		CONTACT: Lisa Stapleford		CONTACT: Sondra Chmiola		CONTACT: Kevin Kilmartin		CONTACT: Brent Golding	
WITNESS:		PHONE: 800-288-7974		PHONE: 847-608-8130		PHONE: 757-620-1254		PHONE: 410-391-9100 xt22	
BID TITLE:		Bulk Solar Salt							
COMMODITY/ SERVICE		UNIT COST		TOTAL		UNIT COST		TOTAL	
QTY (Tons)									
Bulk Solar Salt – F.O.B. Berry Farm, Verona, VA 24482		\$ 139.30		\$ 20,895.00		NO BID		\$ 147.20 \$ 22,080.00	
Bulk Solar Salt – F.O.B. Dices Spring, Weyers Cave, VA 24486		\$ 136.00		\$ 13,600.00		NO BID		\$ 147.20 \$ 14,720.00	
Bulk Solar Salt – F.O.B. Ashby Well, Churchville, VA 24421		\$ 140.10		\$ 14,010.00		NO BID		\$ 147.20 \$ 14,720.00	
Fuel Escalation Clause?		Yes or No		No		YES		NO	
Price Escalation/descalation?		Yes or No		No		UNK		N/A	
TOTAL		\$ 48,505.00		NO BID		\$ 51,520.00		\$ 46,007.50	
Terms/Discount		Net 30		NO BID		Net 30		Net 30	
Grand Total		\$ 48,505.00		NO BID		\$ 51,520.00		\$ 46,007.50	
Delivery:		2-3 days ARO		3 days ARO		7 days ARO			
Color Coding:									
Comments from bid documents:		No comments		No Bid		No Comment		No Comment	
APPARENT LOW BIDDER									
NO BID									