

**Janitorial Services**  
**Invitation to Bid (ITB) # 1754**  
**Augusta County Service Authority**  
 Tuesday, December 12, 2017  
 2:00 PM  
 Opened By: Casey McCracken  
 Witness: Raquel Cross

**BID TABULATION**

Vendor	Addendum 1	Main Office Lump Sum (12 Months)	Field Office Lump Sum (12 Months)	Full Carpet Cleaning	Tile Strip & Wax	Indoor Window Cleaning
Jan-Pro Cleaning Systems of Richmond	Yes	\$41,730.00	\$25,980.00	\$0.30/SF	\$0.50/SF	No Bid
H&R Contractors, Inc	Yes	\$22,750.00	\$3,575.00	\$1,800.00	\$414.75	No Bid
ServiceMaster Cleaning of Charlottesville & Augusta County	Yes	\$15,214.00	\$3,574.00	\$1,200.00	\$990.00	No Bid
T and A Cleaning	Yes	\$15,000.00	\$2,880.00	\$0.40/SF	\$0.20/SF	No Bid
JB Wilson Enterprises Corp	Yes	\$14,256.00	\$3,324.00	\$0.19/SF	\$0.21/SF	No Bid
Tri County Maintenance	Yes	\$14,500.00	\$1,600.00	\$912.45	\$349.00	No Bid
Janitorial Services of VA	Yes	\$15,576.00	\$3,360.00	\$1,263.50	\$892.50	\$165.00
S&W Maintenance Service, Inc.	Yes	\$46,500.00	\$10,500.00	\$1,162.00	\$1,445.00	No Bid
MAID2ORDER LLC	Yes	\$15,093.00	\$2,012.16	\$0.38/SF	\$0.38/SF	No Bid
Thompson's Custom Cleaning, LLC	Yes	No Bid	\$13,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
G&K Facilities Maintenance Inc	Yes	\$10,200.00	\$18,200.00	\$0.25/SF	\$0.40/SF	No Bid

\*Apparent Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder